Surplus Property Bids 2023

2007 Ford F150 Unit 1

2007 Ford F150 Unit 2

2007 Ford Ranger Unit 3

23007 Ford Ranger Unit 4

30x30 Tent

2017 Hustler

Log Splitter

Water tank

Sander

Scroll Saw

Sign Router

Fisher Marine

Wood Shaper

Engine Hoist

Engine Stand

Disk

Total

LaBaw
Pruitt
LaBaw
Newman
Fox
Courson
Pate
Sechriest
Johnson
Galey
Wernigk
Johnson

Eickhoff

Kotcher
McElroy

Fox

Fox

Obenland

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
Kedas

$1,806.00
$3,000.00
$2,156.00
$1,510.00
$2,000.00
$3,100.00
$550.00
$1,351.00
$1,250.00
$1,220.00
$711.00
$500.00
$450.99

$207.00
$201.00

$100.00
$100.00

$250.00

High Bid

$  1,806.00
$  3,000.00
$  2,000.00
$  3,100.00
$  550.00
$  1,351.00
$  711.00
$  207.00
$ 100.00
$ 100.00
$  250.00
$  400.00

$ 13,575.00



